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Assignment Reference DocumentNo |Typ |Doc..Date |Arrear |[Net duedt | Amtinloc.cur. |LCurr|Text

91156876 GSRO/SAARC/2011/ 91156876 RV 113.10.2011{2,678 [12.11.2011 |4,880.00 MVR

91187409 GSRO/SAARC/2011/ |91187409 RV 123.10.2011{2,668 [22.11.2011]1,095.51 MVR

91200266 GSRO/SAARC/2011/ 91200266 RV |27.10.2011{2,664 |26.11.2011|1,643.26 MVR

91274571 GSRO/SAARC/2011/ |91274571 RV [23.11.2011|2,637 |23.12.20113,156.74 MVR

426AST0201201 | 1400061788 1400070498 |DZ |27.12.2014|2,072 [10.07.2013)54,929.89 MVR |Residual Open Item of 1800071568
65,705.40 MVR




3/25/2019 Secretariat of the AdduCity Council Mail - Fwd: Outstanding payment

‘!’ Fathimath Eemaan Shathir <eamaan@adducity.gov.mv>

CITY OF ADCAS

e

Fwd: Outstanding payment

1 message

Ibrahim Labeeb <labeeb@adducity.gov.mv> Sun, Mar 24, 2019 at 2:46 PM
To: Fathimath Eemaan Shathir <eamaan@adducity.gov.mv>, Aminath Uswa <aminath.uswaa@adducity.gov.mv>

shukuriyyaa

Ibrahim Labeeb

Assistant Director

Secretariat of the Addu City Council
Addu City, Republic of Maldives

Tel: (960) 688 5003
Fax: (960) 6885002
Email:labeeb@adducity.gov.mv

» Descri ption: Description: 551961_145706608904941_1525617075_n

CONFIDENTIALITY
The infarmation contained in this message and any attachments are intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed,
It may contain privileged or confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient you must not copy, distribute or toke any action in relignce on it

If vou have received this e-mail in error please notify the sender. Thank You

P A please consider the environment before printing this e-mail

Forwarded message ---------

From: Hassan Aanish <hassan.aanish@stomaldives.net>

Date: Sun, Mar 24, 2019 at 2:10 PM

Subject: Outstanding payment

To: labeeb@adducity.gov.mv <labeeb@adducity.gov.mv>

Cc: Admin.properties <Admin.properties@stomaldives.net>, admin@adducity.gov.mv <admin@adducity.gov.mv>

Dear Labeeb,

Please find attached outstanding statement details. As per our company policy we can't lease any property if the party
have any outstanding payments. Therefore you need to pay this full amount. After that we can go ahead with leasing
agreement.

Thank You & kind Regards

Hassan Aanish

hitps://mail.google.com/mail/u/27ik=bc7480a58b&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1628879799390421471&simpl=msg-f%3A16288797993... 1/2
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